To: Richard Kahn || |

From: Jeffrey Epstein
Sent: Wed 9/12/2012 4:59:51 PM

Subject: Re: SEED
try
On Wed, Sep 12, 2012 at 12:58 PM, Richard Kahn <, rotc:

should 1 press on all money this week, fed ex or messenger vs regular mail they are proposing
please advise

Richard Kahn
HBRK Associates Inc.

Begin forwarded message:

From: Vera Savcic <{ I -

Date: September 12, 2012 12:54:42 PM EDT
To: Richard Kahn

Hi Rich:

One payment 1s going out today for July. T prefer to send by mail if you don't mind but will
put in the mail today. I generally avoid fed ex and messenger because I continue
to be cost conscious.

As an fy1 the check 18 made out to Adam and he endorsed 1t so you can deposit it. Seed's
liability is with Adam so | need to continue to pay Adam.

As for August and September, I expect to be able send August next week pursuant to a
payment [ am waiting for from GE and September the following week based on a
receivable from The Weather Channel.

[ had originally anticipated both payments to be received by now, but our GE contact had
a baby so her replacement is a bit slow and the Weather Channel invoice was
dated later than originally expected hence will be paid later.

Let me know if you have any questions.

Vera
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On Sep 10, 2012, at 9:44 AM, Richard Kahn wrote:

can you please confirm payments (6,000 x 3 = 18,000) will be made
this week

i prefer wire however if you will be paying via check please fed ex or
messenger to address below

thank you

Richard Kahn
HEREK Associates Inc.

Begin forwarded message:

From: Adam Bly <
Date: August 21, 2012 12:48:02 PM EDT
To: Jeffrey Epstein <
Cc: Richard Kahn
Subject: Re: Interest calculation

Wera will prepare an a/r report
On 21 Aug 2012, at 12:22, Jeffrey Epstein wrote:

rich review their accts recivable please

On Tue, Aug 21, 2012 at 10:57 AM, Adam Bly

- - . rotc:

Vera informed me this morning that she
has three payments scheduled for the week
ending sept 14 covering july, august,
september. That's the best we can do given
the cash flow swings we arec managing
(without bank financing) and which |
mentioned to both of you, Appreciate your
patience.

On 20 Aug 2012, at 16:56, Richard Kahn wrote:

EFTA_R1_00303334
EFTA01886738



although adam said mmterest
was due on the 16th of the
month the attached schedule
from his cfo shows that
interest is due on the | 1th of
each month

adam has not paid july 11th or
august | 1th interest

total due 12,000

please advise

Richard Kahn
HBRK Associates Inc.

Begin forwarded message:

From: Vera
Savcic

Date: May 23,
2012 1:13:08

PM EDT

To: Rich Kahn

Subject:
Interest
calculation

Attached
<Int Calc May 11 2012 .xlsx>

Vera Savcic
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The imformation contammed n this communication 1s
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeftrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copymg of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return ¢-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
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communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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