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From: Jeffrey Epstein
Sent: Tue 8/21/2012 8:56:41 PM

Subject: Re:
ok

on Tue, Aug 21, 2012 at 4:53 M. ||| | KGR - -

Antoine is fine with $10,000 for his day fee plus the extra for hair and makeup which would be
513,600, Is this OK to pay?

Begin forwarded message:

From: Lera |

Subject: Re:
Date: August 21. 2012 4:50:16 PM EDT
To: i

[ talked to Antoine, he's fine with this. 13,600 + tax
Should I revise the invoice?

Kind regards,

LERA LOEB

ANTOINE VERGLAS STUDIO
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MOBILE:

PHONE
« -
-

Flease fallow Antoine Verglas on TUMBLR &

Twitter

S8 o8 e e e o8 08 ol e e ol e 0B o e e ol ol ol e e e e 0B ol e e e B 0B ol e e e 0B 0B e e e e 0B ol e e ol ol 0B o o e ol ol ol e ol o ol B 0

The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-chient privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of
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Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail. com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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