
To: Richard Kahn[ 
From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent: Mon 8/27/2012 9:18:52 PM 
Subject: Re: press/ website expenses 

ok 

On Mon, Aug 27, 2012 at 4:59 PM, Richard Kahn e > wrote: 

is it ok to pay expenses of 4,991.56? 
please note of that amount 3,141 has not yet been incurred as this represents a prepayment for 
10 press articles at a 10% discount 
please advise 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York. New York 10022 
tel 
fax 

cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: 
Date: August 24, 2012 1:01:31 PM EDT 
To: Richard Kahn n> 
Subject: 
Reply-To: 

Hi Rich, 

I hope you are well. I am going to do another string of press articles this month and will 
purchase a pack of 10 at a 10% discount. Below are some remaining expenses owed 
and the cost of the packet. The total amount is: $4,991.56. I have attached an excel 
sheet showing my records of expenses. I also keep all the receipts in a folder in 
Jeffrey's gmail account. Am glad to forward them over to you whenever you need. 

Could you n h k vr for h m n?Th wo I be easiest. My mailing address again 
is: . This should cover me until mid to late 
Sept. 

Thanks Rich and hope you had a restful summer. 

date item title cost 
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24-May-12 GoDaddy website design package $ 79.68 

13-Jun-12 press release overword charge $ 170.00 

17-Jun-12 press release overword charge $ 170.00 

18-Jun press release overword charge $ 170.00 

20-Jun-12 press release overword charge $ 85.00 

21-Jun-12 press release overword charge $ 85.00 

11-Jul-12 Google Wallet Domain Registration blog $ 10.00 

13-Jul-12 press release base charge $ 349.00 

19-Jul-12 Google Wallet Domain Registration forum $ 10.00 

21-Jul-12 press release base charge $ 349.00 

23-Jul-12 GoDaddy search engine optimization $ 23.88 

24-Jul-12 press release base charge $ 349.00 

TOTAL: $ 1,850.56 

packet of $349 at a 10% 
discount: 

$ 3,141.00 

TOTAL: $ 4,991.56 

cell: 
email: 
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The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to icevacationggmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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