
To: 
From: a rey pstein 
Sent Fri 9/14/2012 11:52:33 PM 
Subject: Re: Gil invoice 

yes„ also living room now shorting out, poease check when you return 

On Fri, Sep 14, 2012 at 5:50 PM, a> wrote: 

Jeffrey, 
Rich and spoke in regards to gulfstream invoice, and asked that I obtain your approval. 

You are correct, the rebill regarding the invoice I received from Gulfstream is normal, 
We sent our Spoiler actuators for overhaul-exchange, corrosion was found beyond limits which 

required additional parts to both actuators,.$16k per unit. 
May I have your approval to pay gulfstream the $32k owed? 

Thank you 
Larry 

Sent via BlackBerry by AT&T 
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