
To: LSJ • • 

Cc: Richard Kahn 
From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent Sat 9/1/2012 11:42:52 AM 
Subject Re: Barge work 

I suggest on the 6, you give boscoe the option of reduced pay to 30k per year, or to be released . 
shimrimo same deal 

On Sat, Sep 1, 2012 at 7:17 AM, LSJ wrote: 

Agree 
Boscoe has just called had a lengthy conversation i will not go into the details but bottom line 
he will be sending a breakdown of what all the overruns are what he has been doing and a 
timeline 
I have asked him to complete this tonight not while he should be working - full day 
Still plan on sending Carlos 
K 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Sep 1, 2012, at 6:45 AM, Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

more bull no real what have you done 

 Forwarded message 
From: Boscoe 
Date: Fri, Aug 31, 2012 at 7:30 PM 
Subject: Fwd: Barge work 
To: jeevacation@gmail.com 

I did not know Rich was away. 
I need to keep after this to keep it from getting worse. 

Please advise if you want me on LSJ Or at the boatyard tomorrow. 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Boscoe 
Date: August 31, 2012 11:20:47 AM GMT-04:00 
To: Richard Kahn ‹ > 
Cc: Monique Harry
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Subject: Barge work 

Hi Rich 

This barge refit has issues. There are items on the list that will cost more than the 
original estimate will cover. 

I have already gone into sorting out the individual job items and segregated the 
labor hours, to date, on each. 

Meeting this morning, SBDD and I have adjusted hourly rates and material 
costs  but, we are not done with the job and I need to know how 
you want me to proceed with recording the additional costs and 
work needed to complete the tasks. 

The big difference is unforeseen damage and extra labor time expended removing 
heavily corroded parts and additional wear to the ramp that needed 
attention. We also have alignment issues with the motors that must 
be fixed. Also found were two cracked support struts. The steering 
system is a mess and is being sorted out as I compose this. 

Any wiggle room that WAS in the estimate, is long gone now. 
When I met with Gene this morning the labor cost, to date, was $17,325.. 
We got that figure down to $11,250 and a price reduction on the aluminum plate 

from $2240 per sheet to $2000 per sheet. (two used) 

I am going back to each job now to try to get a handle on how much more money 
and how much more time it's gonna take to finish. I will do nothing 
more than is absolutely necessary regarding these repairs. Please 
advise, as I have no idea what You will need to see. 

Thank you 

Sent from my iPhone 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
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return e-mail or by e-mail to jeo acation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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