
To: Jeffrey Epstein[jeevacation©gmail.com] 
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Tue 8/28/2012 1:25:48 PM 
Subject: shutter of 10' x 15' opening from PSI vendor 

fyi 
Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York. New York 10022 
tel 
fa 

cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Janusz Banasiak 
Date: August 27, 2012 5:26:37 PM EDT 
To: Richard Kahn 
Subject: Re: permit or pstem 

It was done by phone conversation. 
On Aug 27, 2012, at 4:11 PM, Richard Kahn wrote: 

was this an informal verbal quote or do you have backup? 
please advise 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York, New York 10022 
tel 

cell 

On Aug 24, 2012, at 10:41 AM, Janusz Banasiak wrote: 

S5,100. 
On Aug 22, 2012, at 3:38 PM, Richard Kahn wrote: 

can you also ask shutter company to price a 
generic motorized shutter for a 10' x 15' 
opening 
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thank \ (nt 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York. New York 10022 
tel 
fax 

cell 

On Aug 21, 2012, at 3:47 PM, Janusz Banasiak wrote: 

Thanks by mail/fedex 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Aug 21, 2012, at 2:56 PM, Richard Kahn 

wrote: 

will have signed 
and notarized today 
should i email or 
send down via mail 
/ fed ex 
please advise 
thanks 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates 
Inc. 
575 Lexington 
Avenue, 4th 
Floor, 
New York, New 
York 10022 
tel 
fax 

cell 

On Aug 20, 2012, at 9:46 AM, Janusz Banasiak wrote: 

Hi 
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Rich, 
we 
need 
JE to 
sign 
and 
notariz 

permit 
form to 
install 
new 
shutter 
s. 
Janusz 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: eddi scozzari 

Subject: permit for Epstein 
Date: Au ust 17 2012 2:58:10 PM EDT 

e - o: e i scozzari 

hi Janusz, 
I received the deposit check today. Thank 
you. 
Please have the Epstein sign the attached 
permit form before a notary public and return 
the original to us via mail. 
Let me know if you have any questions. 
Thank you, 
Colleen 

Action Hurricane Shutters Inc. 
WWW.actionhurricanc.com 
ph 
fax 
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