To: Melanie Spinella[spinella@apoliolp.com]
From: Jeffrey Epstein

Sent: Fri 4/5/2013 10:24:32 PM

Subject: Re:

cilleen said that there are no bronzes

On Fri, Apr 5, 2013 at 6:22 PM, Melanie Spinell_ wrote:

It's included in the art insurance payment. There is no separate bill for the bronzes
Sent from my iPhone

On Apr 5, 2013, at 6:21 PM, "Jeffrey Epstein”
<jeevacation{@ gmail. com<mailto:jeevacation(@gmail.com>> wrote:

eileen said that there is no inventory , detailed appraisal, for chinese, bronzes, eileen said that
leon pays the insuracne premium Himself. 77777she sad she never saw the check???
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