To:

From: Jeffrey Epstein

Sent: Thur 4/4/2013 11:38:55 AM

subject: Re: ] Reimbursement Aug - Dec 2012

yes

On Thu, Apr 4, 2013 at 7:24 AM, _ wrote:

Below are - amounts for Aug 2012- December 2012
The amount under .' is mainly for a coat which she had made.
May I approve?

The breakdown:

JE 1090.97
2336.73

medical 600
travel 166.62

taxi + misc 275.35
2G 394 .99
Total 4864 .66

Excel:

S8 o e e e e ol ol e e ol ol ol o e e ol ol ol e e e e ol ol e e e e ol e e e e ol ol e e e e ol ol e e ol ol ol o e e ol ol ol e o o ol ol o

The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-chient privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressce. It 1s the property of

Jeftrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thercof 1s strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
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return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all nights reserved
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