
To: 
From: 
Sent: 
Subject: 

Jeffrey Epstein 
Mon 3/25/2013 11:28:06 AM 
Re: 

On Mon, Mar 25, 2013 at 11:28 AM, wrote: 

i will check with her. 
the quality coresponded the payment )), it was 4000 per a year ) +. (never understood 
what was it?? ) 
for icon thank you, but i worked for it as well )))) 
so, i know i can do better but for more,sorry 

most of all , you are the friend for me and person i care 
all the rest i am ready to discuss it but with precise details and in advance. 

kisses 

2013/3/25 Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com>

send me 
thsi 

s detail.s. . after two years and thousands of euros. you can do better than 

*********************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by c-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

Best regards, 

EFTA_R1_00322911 

EFTA01897182



*********************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

EFTA_R1_00322912 

EFTA01897183


