
To: 
From: 
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yes 

Jeffrey Epstein 
Mon /1/2013 10:26:23 PM 
Re: Reimbursement (Jan 2012 - July 2012) 

On Mon, Apr 1, 2013 at 6:24 PM, wrote: 

has submitted receipts for January 2012 until end July 2012. Bella asked myself or 
to approve them. I have had a look at her expense spreadsheet and seen all the physical 
receipts for the period. 
In total the amounts arc as follows. May I approve so that Bella can go ahead with the transfer 
into her account: 

JE (foods and take out - NY and Palm Beach) - $ 1538.63 

(mostly medical) - $ 818.21 

Apartment 2G (including closets) - $ 2464.55 

Taxi + misc - 167.93 

TOTAL (Jan 2012 - July 2012) - $ 4989.32 
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