To:

Cc: Bella Klein[bklein57S@gmail.com]
From: Jeffrey Epstein

Sent: Wed 3/27/2013 7:39:12 PM
Subject: Re: Sean Lancastor

Yes
On Wednesday, March 27, 2013, wrote:

Jeffrey

Bella requires your approval to pay Bristol and Assoc the amount $13,957.79 owed for Sikorsky
sales advertising,. You previously approved $11,900 which Sean mentioned earlier was not

exact amount owed.

Is 13,957.79 approved to Wire to Bristol ?

Thank you
Larry

Sent via BlackBerry by AT&T
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