
To: jeevacation©gmaitconteevacation©gmail.com] 
From: Steve Hanson 
Sent Tue 3/26/2013 12:48:39 PM 
Subject: Re: Fwd: 

I have contract I worked out with peter in nyc- back mon- but shall I call peter- use the dep for new Mex. - ?? 
But why don't you go back to the boat lady. The fees are much less.7 % if I remember 
and ill bet they have someone that is - just over the water thing- and would love to be on land- near the west 
coast - a slightly older couple then what we found - I would start here- u want me to help start this search and 
scrub resumes from boat captains-

Sent from Steve Hanson's Blackberry 

Proud to be the first national multi-concept restaurant group to be certified Green by the Green Restaurant 
Association 
Confidentiality Notice: This e-mail transmission and any file or previous e-mail attached to it is intended to be 
viewed only by the party to which it is addressed and may contain valuable business information that is 
confidential and/or otherwise protected from disclosure under applicable law. If you are not the intended 
recipient you are hereby notified that any review, disclosure, dissemination or use of any of the information 
contained in or attached to this transmission is STRICTLY PROHIBITED. Thank you for your cooperation. 

From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com> 
To: Steve Hanson 
Sent: Tue Mar 26 06:26:54 2013 
Subject: Fwd: 

 Forwarded message 
From: Richard Kahn 
Date: Mon, Mar 25, 20111,1 
Subject: Re: 
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com>

I have contacted Peter Mahler from Mahler Private Staffing and described the two positions we 
are looking to fill: New Mexico & Celebrity Assistant 
I was very impressed with Peter and organization. They have 700 clients of which 250 are in the 
Forbes 400. 
When i mentioned the LSJ search and the S10,000 paid on our behalf from Steve Hanson i was 
told we have no credit available. 
Peter stated that LSJ search was a big loss for their organization as they spent close to $25,000 
on making 7 qualified candidates available. 
When they were ready to present candidates they were told search was over. 
He also stated that searches arc not transferable to other entities or properties. 

We spoke about fees which are as follows: 
I) 30% of annual salary 
2) 4 month guarantee however this is negotiable 
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3) $10,000 retainer 

Peter is going to send me engagement dots to review for New Mexico & Celebrity Assistant 
Please advise if you would like me to continue searches with Peter 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York, New York 10022 

On Mar 24, 2013, at 10:51 AM, Jeffrey Epstein wrote: 

lets use the headhunter that sieve prepaid to find celebrity asst job 

******** **** *************************** ******************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return c-mail or by c-mail to jecvacati n mail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
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return e-mail or by e-mail to ice\ acation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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