To: Jeffrey Epstein[jeevacation@gmail. com)
From: brice gordon

Sent: Thur 3/21/2013 7:19:52 PM

Subject: Re: RE JJ

resending, Rich will require your approval

On Mon, Mar 18, 2013 at 9:02 PM, brice gordon _-* wrote:

Jeftrey
after removing the TV's from the twin room, Sarah's office, gym and breakfast room, there
will be a need to paint and patch holes from TV mounts and HDMI runs in the wall.

Also we will need to install new TV wall mounts in master and breakfast room to a hang 75 "
TV and run new HDMI/power supplies

| approached JJ for a bid since he was on site

Estimated cost $1410.00

do we have your approval to proceed.

Brice (vordon

New Mexico

Brice Gordon -

New Mexico
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