To: JEE[jeevacation@gmail.com]
From: Cecile de Jongh

Sent: Tue 3/26/2013 3:12:15 PM
Subject: Fw: FTC to STC

Vacation due on closing of FTC.xlsx

Hi Jeffrey,
Please let me know on this as we need to finalize the accounting. Thanks.
With warm regards,

Cecile

DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this e-mail may be privileged,confidential, and
protected from disclosure. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby notified
that any dissemination, distribution or duplication of this communication is strictly
prohibited. If you have received this communication in error, please notify the sender
immediately and delete all copies.

“Mearly all men can stand adversity, but if you want to test a man's character, give him power." ~
Abraham Lincoln

“$ Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

-—-- Forwarded Message —
From: Cecile de Jongh
To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com=>
Sent: Monday, March 25, 2013 10:05 AM
Subject: Re: FTC to STC

With warm regards,

Cecile

DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this e-mail may be
privileged,confidential, and protected from disclosure. If you are not the intended
recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution or
duplication of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify the sender immediately and delete all
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copies.,

“"Mearly all men can stand adversity, but if you want to test a man's character, give him power." ~
Abraham Lincoln

‘P Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.

From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacationi@gmail.com=>
To: Cecile de Jong i i
Sent: Friday, March 22, 2013 5:13 PM
Subject: Re: FTC to STC

please provide details

On Fri, Mar 22, 2013 at 9:33 PM, Cecile de Jongh j i

Wrote:

Hi Jeffrey,

We are wrapping up converting from FTC to STC. One item is accrued
vacation days and roll-overs days. | spoke to Erika and she thinks it
would be cleaner to account for the accrued days in the FTC
termination letters with a monetary settlement so we can start with a
clean slate with STC in April - it will look better re EDC. The aggregate
amount is $13,711.54. let me know if | can proceed to process.

With warm regards,

Cecile

DISCLAIMER: The information contained in this e-mail may be
privileged,confidential, and protected from disclosure. If you are not the
intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination,
distribution or duplication of this communication is strictly prohibited. If
you have received this communication in error, please notify the sender
immediately and delete all copies.

"Mearly all men can stand adversity, but if you want to test a man's character, give
him power." ~ Abraham Lincoln

‘¥ Please consider the environment before printing this e-mail.
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B e L L e e

The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return ¢-mail or by e-mail to jecvacation(@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

EFTA_R1_00327743
EFTA01899600



