
To: Richard Kahi 
From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent Thur 3/7/201310:25:54 PM 
Subject: Re: LSJ Cisterns 

no , ask for labor cost it is only one week, he is full of shit they sent material cost already 

On Thu, Mar 7, 2013 at 6:15 PM, Richard Kahn 

brice has requested deposit of 16,700 be paid for cistern #2 
total job cost is 20,876 
is this ok to release? 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor, 
New York, New York 10022 
to 
fa 

cell 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: brice gordon 
Date: February 24 2013 1411. ...” 
To: Rich Kahn 
Cc: Jeffrey Epstein < 
Subject: LSJ Cisterns 

wrote: 

Rich 
Jeffrey wishes to move forward with the repair of the cisterns at LSJ 
I have attached proposal for your reference, let me know when we can discuss details. 
regards 

Brice Gordon 

USVI 
Phone: 

New Mexico 
Phonc: 
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The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to Lees acation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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