T deanne Brenna N

From: Jeffrey Epstein
Sent: Tue 2/26/2013 8:39:29 PM
Subject: Re: FW: Augustus Henry - February 25, 2013

Ok

On Tuesday, February 26, 2013, Jeanne Brennan wrote:

Jeffrey,

Confirming verbal approval for helper for David Starofsky. - Augustus Henry. Rate 5200 a day (Prior
employee whose pay rate was 525/hour). Waork was on the staff bathrooms. 11 days wark = 52,200.

leanne

e e—
Sent: Tuesday, February 2o, :

To: Jeanne Brennan
Subject: Re: Augustus Henry - February 25, 2013

Hi Jeanne,

Verbal approval from JE to get someone in to help David Starofsky, noting he was on the
approved list forwarded by Anna.

Reference Confidentiality Agreement, my understanding was that former employees were
covered under the agreement they previously had signed under 1G, noting the change in
Policy of getting part time emplovees to sign the L) Employee Confidentiality happened last
week and I have not given him this.

Please advise

Thanks

On Tue, Feb 26, 2013 at 6:25 AM, Jeanne Brennan _ wrote:

Just a reminder to pleasese send me the back up for Augustus Henry as well as a confidentially
agreement before Thursday, so | can release the check on Friday .

Thanks
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Jeanne

From: Daphne Wallace

]
Sent: Mon February 25, 2013 4:40 PM
Tu:ﬂ

Cc: Jeanne Brennan
Subject: Augustus Henry - February 25, 2013

Urccting-

Could you forward for my records the backup/JE approval you have for Augustus' work on the

Statt bathroom, ct.al.

Thanks, DW

LS5J,LLC

[sland Manager

ral

6100 Red Hook Quarters Suite E3
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The mformation contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It 1s the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thercof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
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return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all nights reserved
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