
To: 
From: IL y ps ein 
Sent Mon 3/11/2013 7:47:27 PM 
Subject: Re: GIV prebuy payment 

ok 

On Mon, Mar I I, 2013 at 2:34 PM, wrote: 

Jeffrey, 
Gulfstream requires 100% payment of our prebuy before they will start logbook inspection,. 

-may I have your approval for Rich to wire $73,460.00 at this time? 

$13,000.00 Aircraft records and log book research 
$ 900.00 APU Borescope 
$14,500.00 Engine inspection, Runs and Borescope 
$39,560.00 CMP cards, to include, Wing internal, below floor, FS85 Popping fuselage, Elevator and 
Rudder, remove leading edges of both wings,. 
$ 5,500.00 Test flight with Gulfstream Test Pilots (this item will have additional billing for Pilot 
expense, hotel, food, etc. 
Total pre-buy $73,460.00 

*********************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacationOgmail.com and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
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