
To: Ga Sie al[garysiegaleaol.comi 
Cc: eevacationelgmail.com] 
From: Peggy Siegal 
Sent Sat 3/16/2013 10:29:21 PM 
Subject Re: Fwd: Fw: Annette Siegal's estate 

Have not heard from you. Where is the accounting. Peggy 
Peggy Siegal Company 
Office 212.935.6700 
Mobil 917.783.4113 

From: "Peggy Siegal" <peggysiegal@gmail.com> 
Date: Fri, 15 Mar 2013 18:10:40 +0000 
To: Gary Siegal<garysiegal@aol.com> 
ReplyTo: peggysiegal®gmail.com 
Cc: =IlMjeevacation®gmail.com> 
Subject: Re: Fwd: Fw: Annette Siegal's estate 

Still waiting. 
Peggy Siegal Company 
Office 212.935.6700 
Mobil 917.783.4113 

From: garysiegal*ol.com 
Date: Thu, 14 Mar 2013 11:56:23 +0000 
To: <peggysiegal®gmail.com> 
ReplyTo: garysiegal®aol.com 
Subject: Re: Fwd: Fw: Annette Siegal's estate 

I will follow up with the attorney today. 
Gary 

From: "Peggy Siegal" <peggysiegal®gmail.com> 
Date: Wed, 13 Mar 2013 11:43:24 +0000 
To: Gary Siegal<garysiegal@aol.com> 
ReplyTo: peg,gysiegal®gmail.com 
Cc: 'eevacation®gmail.com>; 
Subject: Re: Fwd: Fw: Annette Siegal's estate 

Please review your last email. 
Where is accounting? 
Peggy 
Peggy Siegal Company 
Office 212.935.6700 
Mobil 917.783.4113 
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From: Garysiegal@aol.eom 
Date: Sat, 2 Mar 20 I 3 12:05:21 -0500 (EST) 
To: <peggysicgal@gmail.com> 
Subject: Fwd: Fw: Annette Siegal's estate 

Peggy, 
I met with Sy Bressler on Thursday, and the accounting has been completed. Bederson is preparing the 
documents, and the lawyers are preparing the necessary paper work for you and Ito sign.The information will be 
forwarded to us shortly. 
Gary 

Gary Siegal 
Satco Products, Inc. 
(201) 9474884- Phone 
(201) 9474820- Fax 
(201) 290-0233- Mobile 
garysiegalasatco.com 
garysiegal@aol.com 
www.satco.com 
www.nuvoliohtino.com 
www.kolourone.com 

From: garysiegal@aolcom 
To: Garysiegal@aol.com 
Sent: 3/2/2013 9:21:53 A.M. Eastern Standard Time 
Subj: Fw: Annette Siegal&apos;s estate 

-----Original Message---
From: Peggy Siegal 
To: Garysiegal 
ReplyTo: peggysiegal©gmail.com 
Subject: Re: Annette Siegal's estate 
Sent: Mar 1, 2013 6:10 PM 

Gary: 

Did you see this. Please respond. 
Happy Birthday tomorrow. 
Peg 
Peggy Siegal Company 
Office 212.935.6700 
Mobil 917.783.4113 

----Original Message---
From: "Peggy Siegal" <peggysiegal@gmail.com> 
Date: Wed, 27 Feb 2013 03:41:49 
To: Gary Siegal<garysiegal@aol.com> 
Reply-To: peggysiegal©gmail.com 
Subject: Annette Siegal's estate 

Dear Gary: 
I hope you will not make any final distributions without my sign off. 

I have been asking for even a draft and see little reason to delay. Neither the Cumberland or other acct 
items will greatly effect the amounts. 
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You and I should come to an agreement before you make any further distribution. 

I would like your commitment to this. Thank you in advance. 
Peggy 
Peggy Siegal Company 
Office 212.935.6700 
Mobil 917.783.4113 
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