
To: Lvjet 
From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent Tue 3/5/2013 1:51:46 AM 
Subject Re: Sean GIV prebuy assistance 

Total 

On Monday, March 4, 2013, Lvjet wrote: 

Jeffrey 
In regards to the $25k you want me to offer Sean for his assistance in Prebuy on 
GIV,. should I pay the S76 advertising sales invoice dated April 30, 2009 in the 
amount of $13,957.79? in addition to the $25K for prebuy, or total of $25K ? 

thanks, 
Larry 
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