
To: Jeffrey Epstein[jeevacation©gmail.com] 
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Tue 2/19/2013 9:00:21 PM 
Subject: Fwd: Travis Case 
LSJ TCASE CK 021913 $1.000.00.odf 

attached is check for Travis for I week of work from Feb 11 - 15th in the amount of S1,000.00 
bricc backup shows an ok from you on Sunday Feb 17th for 2 weeks of work 
Is it ok to release week I pay in the amount of 1,000.00? 

Richard Kahn 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Daphne Wallace 
Date: February 
To: Rich Kahn 
Subject: Travis Case 
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