
To: Jeffrey Epsteinijeevacationegmailcom] 
From: LSJ 
Sent Thur 2/14/2013 5:12:25 PM 
Subject: Re: LSJ_DAVID_STAROFSKY_021413 

Sorry confused yesterday's approved payment? 
I forward a request for check payment on 1/25/13 requesting payment for 1 week 14th Jan to 19 
Feb 
Are you saying he was paid more than requested? 
He should have received $1,000 

Jan 14 is a Monday 
Jan 19 is a Sat 
He worked all those days 

I did not request payment for days he was not here 
The hours of agreed work were 7am to 4pm 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Feb 14, 2013, at 12:36 PM, Jeffrey Epstein leevacationesmail.com> wrote: 

Yesterday's approved payment was 14-19th the back up says he did not work all 
those days 

On Thursday, February 14, 2013, wrote: 

Good Morning 
As requested -
David was away Ian 21st - Jan 27th 
Off Christmas, New Years Day 

He as worked the following -
Sat - 12/22, 1/5, 1/12, 1/19 - will be working this Sat 2/16 
5pm Finish - 11/26, 12/11, 1/3, 1/8, 1/9, 1/10, 1/14, 1/28, 1/31, 2/6, 2/7, 2/8, 
2/11, 2/12, 2/13 
7pm Finish -1/29 

If you require any further information please let me know 
regards 
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LSJ LLC 

******************* ******** ********** ********************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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