To: Jeffrey Epstein[jeevacation@gmail.com)
From: Richard Kahn

Sent: Fri 3/8/2013 3:15:43 PM

Subject: Fwd: David Starofsky

attached is email from [Jfjto jeanne (not sure why you were not on email) with her explanation
of why david completed his contract rationalizing weckend days worked vs holidays and 5
vacation days

as it has not yet been presented for payment we have not paid his final two weeks ($2,000) which
gives you flexibility on how you want to handle

roy sent a request last night to keep david (see below)
please advise if we should extend contract - if so how long? same rate of $1000 per week?

From: Roy Hodges
Date: March 7, 2013 5:31:54 PM EST

To: *(unknown)” <

Subject: Carpenter

Hi Rich,

Another question, David's (the carpenter) contract has run up. It appears to me that we
still have a great deal of projects left for him to complete. Would it be possible to
extend the contract? Looking at what we have gomng on [ would say we need him
for at least another three months.

Roy

Roy & Stephanie Hodges

Begin forwarded message:

From:
Date: March 6, 2013 1:05:06 PM EST
To: Jeanne
Cc: "Richard Kahn (Gmail Contact)" <
Hodges , brice gordon

, Roy

=

L
Subject: Re: David Starofsky

(rood Afternoon To All,
Please note the E Mail below
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David has completed his 3 month contract. I have been tracking his dayvs/hours, although
it was negotiated that he would not work weekends, he has worked 7 weekend
days, 23 hours overtime & worked Presidents day.

He took 5 vacation days, Christmas & New Year off

Outstanding work -

Pergolas, Pops Garden, Thatch, Cover for Transformer Switch, Barge Chocks, Dock Box
Lids, Beach Signs, Mirror MBR

Do vou wish to extend his contract for a further 2 months? Please advise, thank vou

Warmest regards

On Thu, Dec 13, 2012 at 4:06 PM, Richard Kahn <[ - v ot

Jeffrey is ok with no weekend work and 513,000 for time period below however
Holidays {approx. 4) and Rain days must be made up cither on weekends or after
March 2, 2013

Please confirm we are in agreement with David's terms

Thank you

Richard Kahn
HBEK Associates Inc.

On Dec 5, 2012, at 8:29 AM, brice gordon wrote:

OK by David, but no weekend work

On Tue, Dec 4, 2012 at 1:03 PM, Richard Kahn _

wrote:

Jeffrey said he would go forward with a contract price of $13,000
from December 3, 2012 thru March 2, 2013

Please confirm that these terms are acceptable

Thank you

Richard Kahn
HBRK Associates Inc.
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Begin forwarded message:

From: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation@gmail.com>
Date: December 4, 2012 11:44:59 AM EST

To: Richard Kahn F}
Subject: Fwd: David Starofsky

---—------ Forwarded message --—----—--

From: brice gordon

Date: Tuesday, December 4, 2012

Subject: David Starofsky

To: Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation(igmail.com>

Jeftrey

Spoke to David about a 3 mth contract
he would like to propose the following

Start date: 3rd December 2012 to 2nd March, 2013

Contract Price: $15,700.00

Bi Weekly Payments, 6 (@ $2,245.00, last payment $2,230.00

All materials and tools provided by LSJ

Work Schedule, Monday to Friday.

It necessary would work Saturdays, but does have other commitments and
would need at least 2 days prior notice if he is required
to do so.

are you OK with this?

Brice Gordon
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The information contamed m this commumcation 15
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and 1s intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeftrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return ¢-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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