To:
From: Jeffrey Epstein
Sent: Thur 2/7/2013 12:27:09 PM

Subject: Re: P&L 2012

we dont actually know if all jobs are shown in 2011 or 2012, , an audit of invoices from 2010
compared with jobs worked, cash flow statements. , peggys expenses , taxes, payouts. .

On Thu, Feb 7, 2013 at 8:01 AM, Peggy Siegal J| G- o

Bernard:
[ just got up and packing for London._.I leave for the airport at 5:30pm for the British Academy
Awards. I am back on Monday night.

| totally agree with you and David. How do we proceed? Can you call Katia and make an
appointment? She will immediately call Brian for permission. Or do you call Brian and say
you would like to meet with Katia. I am terrified to make either call.

[ can go with you to meet with Katia. Please adwvise.

I can move a lunch with the Israelie Ambassador on Tuesday.. maybe Wednesday is better.
Please advise when you are free and I will make myself available. Tuesday morning [ have an
appointment from 9:30am to 11:30pm... We have a job Tuesday night for HBO.. but that is
later.

Peggy

---——-Origmal Message------

From: Bernard Saint-Donat

To: Peggy Siegal

Subject: P&L 2012

Sent: Feb 6, 2013 11:22 PM

Peggy,

I looked at the P&L for your business n 2012,

Although the revenues are up by 16% compared to 2011 | the bottom line is less than in 2011 by
over 3,000 dollars.

This is because the costs went up by 28% or about 30,000 dollars.

There is a line called others in the consulting category for 109K, 8K for copier, 14K for bank
and finance charges, 6K for EZ pass etc....

[ still think that the next step 1s to meet with Katia and then with Brian. I had a brief
conversation with David Levin today to compare notes from yesteday. He suggests that we
mecet together with Bran, possibly with you. ..

Let's discuss

Best Regards,
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Bernard Saint-Donat
Saint-Donat & Co.

420 Lexington Avenue, Suite 300
New York, NY 10170

(212) 297-6211

(917) 400-5886
bernardi@saintdonat.com
saintdonat(@math. harvard.edu

Peggy Siegal Company
Office 212.935.6700
Mobil 917.783 4113
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