To: Jeffrey Epsteinfjeevacation@agmail com)
Ce: . Roy Hodges|

From: brice gordon
Sent: Thur 3/7/2013 12:39:231 PM
Subject: Re:

Instant hot water already mstalled in Tika

3 boxes completed, 1 to be assembled will completed this week

Cistern work, scheduled for 19th Mar after vou leave, as of yesterday Dennis has not received
deposit check for materials

Reefco, deposit check at FTC today,Reefco on site Tomorrow to confirm pipe layout etc

No to parts ordered, added to John Deere order yesterday should have finalised estimate from one
company, the other is not responding

would like Bob and Roy to review order before we proceed,

2 variable speeds are in at flag pool, stopped Danny from installing others as the the manifolds
from pool line to filters need to be redone

will need to shut the pool down for a couple of days, so will do pumps and manifolds after you go
Solar heat, sorry i have not progressed with this or heat pump hot water heaters, will get
something to you tomorrow

11, forwarded schedule to you this morning, i'm meeting with him again 15th Mar to do final
layout etc

have two landscape companies interested in work at ranch

On Wed, Mar 6, 2013 at 8:40 PM, Jeffrey Epstein <jeevacation(@gmail.com™> wrote:

did we order the instant hot for the tiki?, how many pops garden boxes are finished?? have we
scheduled the cistern work? did we order reefco for librbary , are all parts now ordered, ?
what items are still for sale. afier peter finishes his work we can sell all | are the variable
speed pumps in? solar heat for pools | info. brice , rich said jj wants to start zorro asap;? |
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The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for

the use of the addressee. It 1s the property of

Jeffrey Epstem

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication i error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com. and

destroy this commumnication and all copies thereot,

including all attachments, copyright -all rights reserved
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