
To: peggysiegal 
From: Jeffrey Eps 
Sent Fri 2/8/2013 12:52:14 PM 
Subject: Re: Fw: Mother's Estate 

i have previously sent you the calculation , if you disagree please provide your calcualiton in 
writing, i have been waiting for sys work since october and he said it was merely a delay in 
receiving some old brokerage accting, this should have no bearing on the current acct. 

MMM>On Fri, Feb 8, 2013 at 8:47 AM, Peggy Siegal wrote:

In London. Just got here. Here is Gary's take. Peg 
 Original Message 
From: Gary Siegal 
To: 
RJR... 1M
Subject: Re: Mother's Estate 
Sent: Feb 8, 2013 7:27 AM 

Dear Peggy, 
I sent you at your request, the total approximate amount in both the trust and estate. This does 

not represent your share, but represents the total left which is shared by both of us. The actual 
and final distribution will need to wait until the informal accounting is completed and 
beneficiaries have provided release and refunding bonds. 

As you know by your conversation with Sy Bressler at Bederson last week, this is being 
completed and will be available shortly. 

Sincerely, 
Gary 
-----Original Message 
From: Peggy Siegal 
To: Garysiegal 
ReplyTo: peggysiegal®gmail.com 
Subject: Mother's Estate 
Sent: Feb 6, 2013 7:31 AM 

Dear Gary: 
I am very glad to hear that the 1. 25 million that I am owed is still there. 

Could you please wire this fa amount to me asap. 

I can't imagine professional fees being more than the 200k that would still be left. 

Thank you for your prompt attention. Let's get this behind us as soon as possible. 

Sincerely, 
Peggy 
Peggy Siegal Company 
Office 
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Mobil 

Peggy Siegal Company 
Office ME 
Mobil 

*********************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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