
To: Jeffre E loin 'eevacation mail.corn] 
Cc: 
From: nce gor on 
Sent Sat 2/9/2013 12:29:08 PM 
Subject Re: 

Contact info 

Dennis Barrett 
awaiting bid with, has both original scope of work and 2nd option of 4" with fiberglass and wire 
mesh 

Asencios construction ( you meet Friday) 340 774 0888 
bid for original scope of work came in at $61,750.00 
with us buying material, cost would be 39,800.00 
they arc also interested in equipment. 

Scott Godfrey, I don't have his number, left message with Danny 
Bid for orginal scope of work came in at 76,950.00 

would recommend who ever is awarded this job, supplies us with material list and we purchase. 
96yds of concrete will be required to complete original scope of work 
to simplify project and lessen cost,remove/ replace existing pad and gravel the rest so we can get 
dozer and roller close to shop. 

On Fri, Feb 8, 2013 at 10:40 PM, Jeffrey Epstein <ieevacation@gmail.com> wrote: 

contact phone numbers for all cement bidders please 

*********************************************************** 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

Brice Gordon 
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USVI 
Phone: 340 513 9855 

New Mexico 
Phone: 505 934 2809 
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