To:  brice gordor

From: Jeffrey Epstein
Sent: Tue 3/5/2013 5:30:30 PM
Subject: Re: Three B's

Urs

Yes
On Tuesday, March 5, 2013, brice gordon wrote:

Jeftrey

attached contract from JJ and cost breakdown, as requested he lowered his price for the site

wall stucco from 36k to 30k

Does Rich have your approval to proceed with deposit
total cost $89, 580.00

regards

Brice Gordon

USVI

New Mexico
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