To: Jack Ryan(j
Cc: Richard Kah . J Epstein[jeevacation@gmail.com)

From: LSJ
Sent: Tue 2122013 7:13:08 PM
Subject: Fwd: LSJ_AMEX_020613

Hi Jack

Thanks, pleased to know that you located approvals, appreciate you looking further into this
Will let Daphne know to expect them at Tropical

Thanks again

Warmest regards

Sent from my 1Phone

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Jack"
Date: February 12, 2

| have to apologize, | just found the approvals for the pathway lights and the Gator ball
joint. They were attached to the 3/4" Black Pipe that | already sent you, This was my
mistake and | truly apologize. | will get these ordered immediately. The ball joint | can
have quickly and the lights | will put a rush on them. Again I'm sorry | missed these.

Sincerely

Jack

Jack Ryan
American Export Compan

From: Karen Gordon
Sent: Wednesday, February 06, 2013 12:34 PM
To: Jack
Subject: Re: LS]_AMEX_020613

Hi Jack,
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Thanks, will work on this
all the hest

On Wed, Feb 6, 2013 at 1228 M, Jock D

wrote:
Hi

Have not seen any approvals from Rich. | ema Iec-abOut it and he was going to
look into it. Please let me know

R13010803 - PATHWAY LIGHTS
R1301093 - PRO GATOR BALLJOINT
R1301034 - TIRES

He usually sends them over same day.

Regards,

Jack

Jack Ryan
American Export Company

From: Karen Gordon [mailto
Sent: Wednesday, February 06, 2013 12:21 PM
To: Jack Ryan

Subject: LS]_AMEX_020613

Crood .-{jff-r_'f'nmm Jack,

I am hoping that you can help me with this, I am trying to confirm if the
following Quotes that I forwarded for Rich to approve have been approved or no,
not receiving a clear answer from this end
Ouoies - RIZ0OT0803, RI301093 which I forwarded 1/9/13

R1301034 which I forwarded 1/22/13

Any info would be helpful
Thank you so much
Warmest regards
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