To: Jeffrey Epsteinfjeevacation@gmail.com)]
From: Richard Kahn

Sent: Tue 1/29/2013 8:04:40 PM

Subject: Fwd: Table for JE!

please advise
Richard Kahn
HERK Associates Inc.

Begin forwarded message:

From: jessica banks
Date: January 29, 2013 11:09:38 AM EST

To: Richard Kahn <
Subject: Re: Table for JE!

Hi Richard,

Thanks for letting me know. I'd love to know the reason he gave, if any - or if vou are at
liberty to say.

Appreciate your feedback though.

On Tue, Jan 29, 2013 at 9:35 AM, Richard Kahn _ wrote:

When i reviewed attached with Jeffrey he asked that i cancel table order
Please contact me with any questions
Thank you

Richard Kahn
HBRK Associates Inc.

cell

On Jan 26, 2013, at 4:09 PM, jessica banks wrote:

Hi Richard,
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Attached please find the Invoice for down payment of the Float
coffee table.
Let me know if you have any questions.

Thanks!

Jess

On Fri, Jan 25, 2013 at 4:14 PM, Richard Kahn _

Wrote:

sorry to be a pest but wondering if you had mvoice
thanks

Richard Kahn
HBRK Associates Inc.

ce

On Jan 24, 2013, at 12:39 PM, jessica banks wrote:

will send invoice shortly....

On Thu, Jan 24, 2013 at 11:36 AM, Richard Kahn

can you please send me information
thank you

Richard Kahn

Floor,

cel
On Jan 24, 2013, at 10:18 AM, Lesley Groff wrote:
Morning Jessica...can you send me the

information on the table Jeffrey wishes to
purchase for your event?! | have CC'd
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Rich in our accounting dept. so he can
take care of payment

Thanks, Les

JESSICA BANKS ! CO-FOUNDER

JESSICA BANKS /| CO-FOUNDER

ROCKPAPERROBOT.com
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