From: Jeffrey Epstein
Sent: Thur 1/31/2013 2:52:43 PM

the palm quote should have been changed to reflect three 15’ palms and seven 12' palms
(quote below has it reversed with seven 15' palms and three 12’ palms - i will have them
change that)

the price remained at 250 for both the 12" and 15'

total cost 2,500

the sod quote reflected the change in quantity to 29,000 sq feet at 0.37 per sq ft - total cost
10,880 (with 130 mspection charge)

1 know when we met you said price should be 0.20 however vendor would not budge on pricing
vendor states that their actual rate for 2012 is 47 cents per square foot - they are offering it to
LSJ at 37 cents per square foot

In nov 2011 we paid 0.35 per square foot and they would not even honor that price

please advise

Richard Kahn
HBRK Associates Inc.

Begin forwarded message:

From: Daphne Wallace <
Date: March 19, 2012 1:04:06 PM EDT

To: Rich Kahn

Subject: Fwd: Fw: Cotizacion de palmas y grama
Greetings Rich,
The revised quotes for JE review and approval, DW

--=------- Forwarded message ----------

From: Carlos Rodriguez < || NG
Date: 2012/3/19
Subject: Fw: Cotizacion de palmas y grama

To: Dapine Wallace
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----- Forwarded Message

From: Ingrid Rivas <
To:

Cc: Jose Ortiz
Sent: Monday, March 19, 2012 12:34 PM
Subject: Cotizacion de palmas y grama

Carlos

Buenas tardes,

Espero que te encuentres bien. Aqui te envio las dos cotizaciones corregidas como
me pidio, las palmas y la grama.

Espero llamada manana st van a comprar el matenal, para coordinar las plataformas.

Saludos,

Ingnd
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The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute mside information, and 1s intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thercof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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