
To: Jeffrey Epsteinfieeyacation©gmail.corn] 
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent: Thur 2/21/2013 6:59:51 PM 
Subject: Fwd: Feb wire 

claims her work is for arrears 
Her contract ended on Nov 15 and when she was paid on dec 18th you said to pay her but mark 
period dcc 15 - jan 15 
her next payment made on jan 17th stated it was for jan 16 - feb 15 
Do you want me to communicate this to her? 
Please advise 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: > 
Date: February 21, 2013 1:51:54 PM E T 
To: Richard Kahn < > 
Subject: Re: Feb wire 
Reply-To: 

Hi Rich, 

Not yet. I need to send him an update about moving forward. I will do that today. 
The Feb 15th $4000 wire though is separate. It's for my work in arrears 
(Jan 15th - Feb 15th). I will email you and Jeffrey a summary of my Jan -
Feb work now. 

thank you, 

m inifid Kahn 
To: 
Sent: Thursday, February 1, 1 1 : 
Subject: Re: Feb wire 

did. give you feedback on continuing? 
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please advise 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 

On Feb 17, 2013, at 4:51 PM, wrote: 

Hi Rich, 

Thank you for sending February's 15th wire for $4000. I will 
send an update to Jeffrey tonight or tomorrow. I don't know if 
he wants to continue to March. But I will send the update and 
see what he thinks after that. 

Th u 
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