
To: 
From: Jeffrey Epstein 
Sent Wed 2/6/2013 1:14:38 PM 
Subject: Re: Mothers Estate 

you were going to give the two jewelry appraisal numbers, 

On Wed, Feb 6, 2013 at 8:31 AM, Peggy Siegal wrote: 

Dear Gary: 
I am very glad to hear that the 1. 25 million that I am owed is still there. 

Could you please wire this full amount to me asap. 

I can't imagine professional fees being more than the 200k that would still be left. 

Thank you for your prompt attention. Let's get this behind us as soon as possible. 

Sincerely, 
Peggy 
Pe Sie al Com an 
Offic 
Mobi 
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