
To: 
Cc: 
Fran: 
Sent 
Subject: Re: Re steel 

Thur 1/31/2013 6:23:59 PM 

eevacation@gmail.comj: Kahn Richard 

Confirming  that E Mail has been forwarded to all parties, approved to pay 

On Thu, Jan 31, 2013 at 1:53 PM, Brice a wrote: 

Bucksteel leave today 
As per there contract they are to be payed upon completion of there work 
Do I have your approval to pay them 

LSJ, LLC 

St Thomas 
USVI 00802 

Tel: 
Fax: 

EFTA_R1_00341530 
EFTA01907523


