To: Jeffrey Epstein[ieevacation@gmail.com)]
From: Richard Kahn

Sent: Thur 1/31/2013 6:58:02 PM

Subject: Re:

totally agree that no money should be paid
i prefer to communicate this to dustin or heidi once they leave stt
just called and left message for you with jen to review dustin, car and a few other topics

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue, 4th Floor,
New York, New York 10022

tel
fa
cell

On Jan 31, 2013, at 1:27 PM, Jeffrey Epstein wrote:

Time together paid for our crashed car
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