
To: Jeffrey EpstniMMINI 
Cc: brice gordo 
From: Richard Kahn 
Sent Thur 1/10/2013 8:07:09 PM 
Subject Re: Sucecion J. Seralles Second - January 8, 2013 

Jeffrey 
Three items we previously purchased: 
Bouganvillea (3 gallon) 100 9.50 = 950.00 (on 10/28/2010 we purchased 500 for 5.75 each) 
Citric Fertilizer 20 ® 68.00 = 1,360.00 (on 12/6/2011 we purchased 20 for 66.70 each) 
Jasmine Sambas (3 gallon) 50 ® 9.50 = 475.00 (on 12/6/2011 we purchased 250 for 5.00 each 
however they were 1 gallon size) 

Two items on list we never purchased before 
Gardenias (3 gallon) 50 ® 9.50 = 475.00 
Frangipani (3 gallon) 50 47.50 = 4,750.00 

Please advise 

Richard Kahn 

INS 
On Jan 9, 2013, at 6:13 PM, Jeffrey Epstein wrote: 

is the samw price as last time? if so ok 

On Wed, Jan 9, 2013 at 7:12 PM, brice gordon 

Jeffrey 
can you please confirm your approval to the attached invoices 

 Forwarded m 
From: Richard Kahn 
Date: Wed, Jan 9, 201 a : 
Subject: Re: Suceci 8, 2013 
To: Dap 
Cc: Bric .Xaren Gordon 

Brennan 

wrote: 

,Jeanne 
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has JEE approved this order? 
please provide email or note if it was verbal 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc 

On Jan 9, 2013, at 3:08 PM, Daphne Wallace wrote: 

Greetings B, 

Attached is the invoice the PR nursery sent to Tropical for the 
pending shipment. It is not coconut palms. Please advise, DW 

On Tue, Jan 8, 2013 at 11:55 AM, Brice wrote: 

Got it 
It's flat rack of coconut palms 

Brice M Gordon 

On Jan 8, 2013, at 12:35 PM, Daphne Wallace ote: 

> Greetings B, 

> The PR nursery has booked a container or flatrack with Tropical (BOL10625416) 
in anticipation of your potential order, DW 

<Sucesion J Serralles 01-003-2013.pdf> 

Brice Gordon 

USVI 
Phone 

New Mexico 
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Phone: 

The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacationqtumail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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