From: Jeffrey Epstein
Sent: Tue 121172012 8:47:54 PM
Subject: Re: media room proposal with out new remote

ask him to return amp. and send ..

On Tue, Dec 11, 2012 at 3:37 PM., Richard Kahn -:1—:f wrote:

Jeft is saying that earliest install of receiver and reprogram of remote is Tuesday and he will
require 70% of attached invoice or $3,764
Please advise

Richard Kahn

Begin forwarded message:

From: "Jeff Sternhell" -:W
Date: December 11, 20 7
To: "Richard Kahn" |

Subject: media room proposal with out new remote

Here is the proposal and invoice for the media room without the new remate, The
earliest we can install this receiver is Tues, I'm sorry but we have already filled this
week's schedule.

Any word on what we should do about the gym and the amp.

Jeff Sternhell

Vice President
Cutting Edge Systems
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The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-chent privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeffrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all nghts reserved

EFTA_R1_00346686
EFTA01910572



