
To: iiiinirevacationSgmail.com] 
From: 
Sent Sat 12/29/2012 9:32:50 PM 
Subject Re: 

I have to pay for my rent before i leave i can come dec 3 after morning school and leave Monday 
night or when you in Florida how better for you 

On Saturday, December 29, 2012, Jeffrey Epstein wrote: 

island until the 10th 

On Sat, Dec 29, 2012 at 3:32 PM, wrote: 

Yes last night , it is snowing today :) where r you at right now ? When r you in Florida? 

On Saturday, December 29, 2012, Jeffrey Epstein wrote: 

maybe next week, are you back yet. ? do you want to come to florida or island? 

On Sat, Dec 29, 2012 at 3:18 PM, ‹ > wrote: 

Is there any way I could send you something for you ? Some sweets as well I backed for 
you :) 
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