
To: Daphne Wallace 
Cc: Jeanne Brennan ; J 
Epsteinljeevacationftmail.com 
From: LSJ 
Sent Mon 12/31/2012 10:35:01 AM 
Subject Re: LSJ_CHECK_STATUS 122812 

Sent from my iPhone 

On Dec 31, 2012, at 6:25 AM, LSJ wrote: 

Good Morning 
Resending this 
I require an answer so as to insure that these individuals will be on site to complete 
their scheduled work 
I also have been contacted by Coral Bay Gardens who also have not received 
payment for their last invoice 
Please advise 
Thanks 

Sent from my iPhonc 

On Dec 28, 2012, at 7:51 PM, LSJ <a ,. wrote: 

Good Evening 
Could I please get an answer to this E Mail as we are trying to 
confirm upcoming work and need to insure that all payments are up to 
date 
Thanks 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From 
Date: December 28, 2012 12:52:21 PM AST 
To: Daphne Wallace 
Subject: LSJ_CHECK_STATUS_122812 

Good Afternoon Daphne, 
Based on your conversation last Friday a check for 
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David should have arrived at FTC by now 
Please advise the status of this late payment. 
Also could you please confirm that the check deposit for 
the cistern work as been processed 
Thanks 

regards 

LSJ,LLC 
Island Manager 
6100 Red Hook Quarters Suite B3 
St Thomas 
USVI 00802 

Tel: 
Fax: 
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