To: Jeffrey Epstein[ieevacation@gmail.com)]

From: Bella Klein
Sent: Tue 12/18/2012 7:27:33 PM
Subject: Re:

12126501934-1218-141917-277 pdf

If you refer to December 13th purchase at Lobel's the bill was $1450.79. Bill 1s attached.

Thank you,
Bella

On Dec 18, 2012, at 2:03 PM, Jeffrey Epstein wrote:

jen asked how much our steaks cost?
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The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of

Jeftrey Epstein

Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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