
To: 
From: 
Sent Fri 12/14/2012 10:13:23 AM 
Subject: Re: Fw: Few things 

e rey ps en 

send as is ,,,today / is glen following the money, ? where is your money from the business 
going? 

On Fri, Dec 14, 2012 at 5:08 AM, Peggy Siegal wrote: 

I am sorry to bother you but I am 20k short on the checks my brother sent. 

The 80k is really 100k from him. 
See below. Can you adjust the email I am to send him and I will fix it, send to you for final 

approval and send. 
----Original Message 
From: Allison Bauman 
To: 
Subject: Few things 
Sent: Dec 13, 2012 6:39 AM 

Wanted To remind you that the 80k check into Morgan Stanley was originally 100k from your 
brother. You and I spoke and you advised me to keep 2ok so you have a cushion in your 
account. Which we currently still have. 

and also deducted from morgan stanley was the amount (i can look for the total amount) to pay 
your personal credit card to zero as per Glenn Davis. 

As we discussed yesterday. Your personal credit card bills are around 20k each month. I am 
trying to keep up with the credit card bill and your other monthly expenses. 

Also I am not involved in the business side. I only deal with personal. Paying your bills etc. 

I may not be in the office today as I am sick with a cold and I am also almost 8 months pregnant. 

Sent from my iPhone 
Peggy Siegal Company 
Offic Mob
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confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
Jeffrey Epstein 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@amail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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