To: Richard Kahn [
From: Jeffrey Epstein
Sent: Wed 7/16/2014 6:37:35 PM

Subject: Re: receipt

yes

On Wed, Jul 16, 2014 at 2:34 PM, Richard Kahn _ wrote:

should 1 have daphne pay and deduct from his next paycheck?
also what is his agenda for NY next week

please advise

thank you

Richard Kahn

HBREK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

tel

fa:

cel

Begin forwarded message:

From: Daphne Wallace [

Subject: Fwd: receipt
Date: July 16, 2014 at 2:30:07 PM EDT

To: Rich Kahn

I do not trust that he will do this. 1 am very sorry, but he did not say one word about not
paying the bill, then he says that lus card was compromised, take payment from
his check, now he wants the hotel to wait yet another 5 days until they get
payment?

Could he have checked into a regular hotel without putting out a card? 1 really feel that
he is taking advantage of the situation and I do not like that feeling.

Please advise, DW

---------- Forwarded message ----------
From: John Christensen

Date: Wed, Jul 16, 2014 at T:2:
Subject: Re: receipt

To: Daphne Wallace
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Hi Daphne,
My credit card was sent to Rich's office. Ill pay Monday
Thank you

John

On Jul 16, 2014, at 2:11 PM, Daphne Wallace _ wrote:

Greetings John,
Please find attached the revised Wll, DW

e===------ Forwarded message ----------

‘ed, Ju 5 at oL

Date:

Subject; receipt
o

<JOHN CHRISTIANSEN.rtf>

please note
The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-chient privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation@ gmail com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
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including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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