To: jeffrey E.[ieevacation@gmail.com]

From: Eileen Alexanderson
Sent: Sun 7272014 1:22:41 PM
Subject: Re:cf

Yes, trust pays $33mil. I've composed a similar table for trust cf but just want to recheck. Will
send to you tomorrow morn but we are good all around the house in terms of covering cash

needs.

On Jul 27, 2014, at 9:12 AM, "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail com> wrote:

is that the calcuation of the split interst?

On Fri, Jul 25, 2014 at 6:25 PM. Eileen Alexanderson _

wrote:

please note
The mformation contained in this communication 1s
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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