To: jeffrey E.[jeevacation@gmail.com]
From: Richard Kahn

Sent: Mon 7/14/2014 4:38:07 PM
Subject: Re:

should i ask amy to define her hourly billing rates?
please advise entity to pay Amy - JEE / NES LLC / HBRK

thank you

Richard Kahn

HBRK Associates Inc.

575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor
New York, NY 10022

On Jul 14, 2014, at 10:24 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail com> wrote:

Ok

=======-=- Forwarded message ----------
From: Amy Cassell <
Date: Monday, July 14, 2014

Subject:

To: "jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail com=

Invoice for the retamner is attached. Please let me know if you have any questions, 1
would like to target a meeting in the middle of August for an initial design review,
if that works with your schedule. Perhaps the meeting can occur at the island, just
let me know your schedule when you can.

Certainly, if there's anything that you see of interest or other thoughts that you have for
the NY residence, please do not hesitate to pass them along or call to discuss

My best,
Amy

On Sun, Jul 13, 2014 at 1:12 PM, Amy Cassell <|||| | | G- ot
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I will put an invoice together, please advise where to send. [ truly look forward
to the project!

Thank you,
Amy

On Sun, Jul 13, 2014 at 12:58 PM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation@gmail.com™> wrote:

Ok.

On Sunday, July 13,2014, Amy Cassell <[} G ot

Sounds good! I agree with the approach of billing hourly. With yvour approval,
I'd like to begin with a retainer of $30,000. This payment would be applied to
the July 2014 invoice and any overage would be applied to the August 2014
mnvoice.

What would you like me to focus on...presuming the NYC residence.

| can come to island anytime but my preference would be to couple it with an initial
presentation for the NYC residence, in a few weeks. Would that work?

My best,
Amy

On Sat, Jul 12, 2014 at 7:17 AM, jeffrey E. <jeevacation(@gmail.com™> wrote:

can you come to the island soon, i think we can /should begin , and like the
structure you suggested , why dont you bill me like the law firm. charge me
for hours spent and lets see after a month or two what it looks like

please note
The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-chient privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacationf@gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
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including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved
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