
To: lawrence delson 
From: Richard Joslin 
Sent Fri 7/11/2014 1:19:10 PM 
Subject FW: charitable commitments 

jeffrey E.beeyacation@gmail.corn) 

Accounting should be responsible for gathering this type of financial information 

From: Eileen Alexanderson 
Sent: Friday, July 11, 2014 9:08 AM 
To: Richard Joslin; Richard D'Agostino 
Subject: FW: charitable commitments 

FYI 

From: Melanie Spinella 
Sent: Friday, July 11, 2014 8:19 AM 
To: Eileen Alexanderson 
Subject: RE: charitable commitments 

Let me ask Leon when he's in on Monday/ thanks 

From: Eileen Alexanderson btha 
Sent: Thursday, July 10, 2014 7:53 PM 
To: Melanie Spinella 
Subject: charitable commitments 

Hi Melanie, Rich and Rich have a $1.5mil commitment to Princeton listed. I thought I 
remembered you saying that this was not likely to be paid off. Should this still be listed as a 
commitment outstanding? 

Thanks, Eileen 
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