
To: Richard Joslin 
Cc: Eileen Alexanderson : lawrence delson 

)[lawrence delson 
Idelson@delsonintl.com[Idelson@delsonintl.comj: jeffrey E.[jeevacation©gmail.com] 
From: Ada Clapp 
Sent: Fri 7/11/2014 1:20:58 PM 
Subject: RE: Requested memos 

Let's discuss this with Larry. Apparently I am not getting my point across well. 

Ada Clapp 

Elysium Management LLC 

445 Park Avenue 

Suite 1401 

New York, New York 10022 

This communication and any attachment is for the intended recipient(s) only and may contain 
information that is privileged, confidential and/or proprietary. If you are not the intended recipient, 
you are hereby notified that further dissemination of this communication and its attachments is 
prohibited. Please delete all copies of this communication and its attachments and notify me 
immediately that you have received them in error. Thank you. 

From: Richard Joslin 
Sent: Friday, July 11, 2014 9:17 AM 
To: Ada Clapp 
Cc: Eileen Alexanderson; Lawrence Delson a; jeffrey E. 
Subject: RE: Requested memos 

In reviewing the Withers invoices on April 291 highlighted to you the 2036 memo and gave you an 
explanation via email. I repeat - Jeffrey request the 2036 memo from Withers in his brainstorming to 
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solve concerns relating to how Ralph had set up Narrows etc. This memo was discussed at our all hands 
meeting in Feb at JEE home. 

What is your support for the assertion that I asked for the private foundation memo? I asked Diane for 
copies for our files — she had indicated she/Withers had prepared the FTLOA memo back when Withers 
was asked to create FTLOA (mid 2013). 

All files and documents are saved in the Art folder on the network where you have shared access. The 
Withers memo's have a June 20 save date - the date DW sent to you and me the memos. 

From: Ada Clapp 
Sent: Friday, July 11, 2014 8:50 AM 
To: Richard Joslin 
Cc: Eileen Alexanderson; Lawrence Delson 
Subject: FW: Requested memos 

Hi Rich—do you have any other memorandum or emails from attorneys relating to the various art 
entities and issues? I did not know you requested the attached. Diana Wierbicki sent them to me after I 
inquired. Are there any others? Please share them. 

Also, it would be a good idea to speak with me before requesting attorneys to prepare memorandum. I 
could have provided one of the attached. 

Thanks. 

Ada Clapp 

Elysium Management LLC 

445 Park Avenue 

Suite 1401 
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New York, New York 10022 

This communication and any attachment is for the intended recipient(s) only and may contain 
information that is privileged, confidential and/or proprietary. If you are not the intended recipient, 
you are hereby notified that further dissemination of this communication and its attachments is 
prohibited. Please delete all copies of this communication and its attachments and notify me 
immediately that you have received them in error. Thank you. 

From: Wierbicki, Diana mailto 
Sent: Friday, June 20, 2014 2:59 PM 
To: Ada Clapp 
Subject: Requested memos 

Hi Ada, 

During my last conversation with Rich, he requested the attached two memorandums for your records. I 
will explain during our call. 

Kind regards. 

Diana 

Diana Wierbicki 

Withers Bergman LLP 

430 Park Avenue. 10th Floor 

New York, NY 10022 
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Withers Bergman LLP 
430 Park Avenue, 10th Floor 

www withersworldsvide corn 

New York, Greenwich, New Haven, London, Geneva, Zurich, Milan, Padua, Hong Kong, British Virgin 
Islands, Singapore 

IRS Required Statement: This document (and any attachments) was not intended or written to be used, 
and it cannot be used by the recipient, for the purpose of avoiding penalties that may be imposed on any 
taxpayer 

This email (and any attachments) is confidential and may also be legally privileged. If you are not the 
intended recipient please immediately notify the sender then delete it from your system. You should not 
copy it or use it for any purpose nor disclose its contents to any other person. 
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