Sent: Sun 7/20/2014 6:42:32 AM
Subject: Fwd: S76 charter quote

Jeffray,

attached is AAG's gquote for Bard Collage Helicopter trip in a Sikorsky STEC++, price $8,349.88 | should be
issued a 10% discount from our S76 purchases with Sikorsky,. which would lower the quote to 57,549.88 range.
We have a credit of $12,363.00 that HSI Helicopter Service Inc. owes us in parts from our S76 purchases, Rich
Kahn and | have been trying to get HSI to issue another check to Hyperion Air LLC or JEGE, LLC, we received
a check issued to Freedom Air International, in which Rich was unable to deposit since Freedom Air has been
dissolved.,.

| am pretty confident we can use the 512,363 money in HSI account to pay for you Helicopter charter,.

would you like to use this money for the Bard Hedli trip?

thank you,
Larry

----- Original Message--———

From: GP SIK AAG Flight Ops <flightops@flyaag.com>=

To: Larry Visoski thL SIK AAG Charter <Charter@flyaag.com>
Cc: GP SIK AAG Flight Ops <flightops@flyaag.com=>

Sent: Sat, Jul 19, 2014 7:47 pm

Subject: RE: [External] Charter quote
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uote for Mr. Jeffrey Epstain for July 27th NYC west side pad

koopsies Hew York, round trip.
dpm to West S5ide Fad.
at 1101bs each.

] Lage
0:30am on July 27th and returr
y a price? Mr Epstein 1B0lbs pluos two pax

by
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