To:  jefirey . (N

From: John Christensen
Sent: Mon 7/14/2014 8:24:34 PM
Subject: Re: Sorry about the noise

No cost. We are only charged when we run it.
On Jul 14, 2014, at 4:23 PM, "jeffrey E." _ wrote:

Cost to park?

On Monday, July 14, 2014, John Christensen _ Wrote:

Sorry about the noise from the excavator. | had Jules park it and he won't back
until Thursday to finish the wall.

We will go in quiet mode until you leave
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