
To: 
From: 
Sent 
Subject: 

jeffrey E. 
Tue 6/24/2014 7:30:41 PM 
Re: Compensation for post separation restrictive coven 

Compensation for post separation restrictive covenant 
Barry I hope you are well 
Pursuant to paragraph 5(d). Add paragraph . In our contract 
if possible 
I would appreciate if payment was able to be made on June 30 
books) Please wire to Add details 
Sorry I missed you in Florida but hope to see you this summer 

Sent from my iPad 

- $500,000.00 is due July 1,2014 

instead of to July 1 ( for my 

in Nantucket - 

On Tuesday, June 24, 2014, wrote: 

Compensation for post separation restrictive covenant 
Barry I hope you are well 
Pursuant to paragraph 5(d). In our contract - $500,000.00 is due July 1,2014 
I would appreciate if payment was made on June 30 as opposed to July I 
Please wire the money to Howard Muchnick trust account -as prior monies have been sent 
Sony I missed you in Florida but hope to see you this summer in Nantucket - 

Sent from my iPad 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please noti us immediate) by 
return c-mail or by e-mail to and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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