From: jeffr .
Sent: Sun 7720012014 9:57:23 AM
Subject: Re: S76 charter quote

go to sleep.  wheels up 5 pm

On Sun, Jul 20, 2014 at 2:42 AM, Lvjet - wrote:

Jeffrey,

attached is AAG's quote for Bard Collage Helicopter trip in a Sikorsky ST6C++, pri
$8,349.88 | should be issued a 10% discount from our S76 purchases with
Sikorsky,. which would lower the quote to $7,549.88 range.

We have a credit of $12,363.00 that HS| Helicopter Service Inc. owes us in parts
from our S76 purchases, Rich Kahn and | have been trying to get HSI to issue
another check to Hyperion Air LLC or JEGE, LLC, we received a check issued to
Freedom Air International, in which Rich was unable to deposit since Freedom Air
has been dissolved,.

| am pretty confident we can use the $12,363 money in HSI account to pay for you
Helicopter charter,.

would you like to use this money for the Bard Heli trip?

thank you,
Larry

-——-0Original Message-—-

To: Larry Visoski : arter R
Cc: GP SIK AAG Flight Ops _
Sent: Sat, Jul 19, 2014 7:47

Subject: RE: [External] Charter quote

ce
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Fractional Ownerahip, Alrcraft Management, Charter Services, Alircraft
Maintenance
VIFP Platinum Salutions. Expariance the Diffarance

A message to AAMG's wvalued Charter Customers. "By Submitting this charter booking

nfirmation, Customer agress t AAG'a standard terms2 and conditions=, which car
e found on AAG"s websita®™
ikoraky b el pt 1LY
----- Original Measa e
Se Saturday, July 1%, 2014 7:2& M
To: DL SIK AAG Chartetr
Subjeat: [External] Charbter guoba

Hello ARG,

I nesd a charter guote for Mr Ju Ith HYC west de pa
to Bard collage by Foughkeep: L.

Filck up 10:30am on July Z2TEh L le Pad.

Can you pls provide a price? Wo pax a 101k h
Thank you

Larey Visoskil

Freedom Air international,

Sent from my iFPhone

please note
The information contained in this communication is
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may
constitute inside information, and is intended only for
the use of the addressee. It is the property of
JEE
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this
communication or any part thereot is strictly prohibited
and may be unlawful. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify us immediately by
return e-mail or by e-mail to jeevacation(@ gmail.com, and
destroy this communication and all copies thereof,
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved

EFTA_R1_00359135
EFTA01918325



