
To: Richard Kahn[ 
From: Jeffrey E. 
Sent Thur 6/12/2014 6:30:30 PM 
Subject: Re: Lyn's dental 

no, give her the 15k 

On Thu, Jun 12, 2014 at 1:33 PM, Richard Kahn wrote: 

lynn told me today that she has 9 teeth plus a crown (10 in total) that cost 1,500 each = 
15,000 
not sure how she is getting to 20's.. 

should i ask for an invoice from doctor and pay as she does her work? 
is there a maximum amount you are approving? 
please advise 
thank you 

Richard Kahn 
HBRK Associates Inc. 
575 Lexington Avenue 4th Floor 
New York. NY 10022 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: Rosalyn Fontanilla 
Subject: Fwd: Lyn's dental 
Date: June 11, 2014 at 1:33:40 PM EDT 
To: Richard Kahn 

Sent from my iPhone 

Begin forwarded message: 

From: "Jeffrey E." <jeevacation@gmail.com>
Date: June 11, 2014 at 1:17:28 PM EDT 
To: Rosalyn Fontanilla 
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Subject: Re: Lyn's dental 

Send to rich 

On Wednesday, June 11, 2014, Rosalyn Fontanilla 
wrote: 

Good afternoon Sir, Sony to bother you again but I dont know if I 
should proceed, Sir, the estimate cost of my dental procedure is in 
20s. What should I do? 

Sent from my iPhone 

please note 
The information contained in this communication is 
confidential, may be attorney-client privileged, may 
constitute inside information, and is intended only for 
the use of the addressee. It is the property of 
JEE 
Unauthorized use, disclosure or copying of this 
communication or any part thereof is strictly prohibited 
and may be unlawful. If you have received this 
communication in error, please notify us immediately by 
return c-mail or by e-mail to jecvacationez gmail.com, and 
destroy this communication and all copies thereof, 
including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 
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including all attachments. copyright -all rights reserved 

EFTA_R1_00359315 

EFTA01918452


